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INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY: CENSUS BUREAU NEEDS TO
IMPLEMENT KEY MANAGEMENT PRACTICES: GAO-12-915

Bibliogov, United States, 2013. Paperback. Book Condition: New. 246 x 189 mm. Language: English . Brand New
Book ***** Print on Demand *****.The U.S. Census Bureau (Census Bureau) has draDed a new investment
management plan, system development methodology, and requirements development and management
processes to improve its ability to manage information technology (IT) investments and system development,
but additional work is needed to ensure these processes are eEective and successfully implemented across the
bureau. GAO and others have identified the importance of implementing critical processes within an agency to
allow it to select, control, and evaluate its IT investments and eEectively manage system development. The
bureau has developed a new draD investment management plan which contains policies and guidance for
managing IT projects; however, the plan does not explain when investments with cost or schedule variances
should be escalated to higher-level boards for review, or when managers should provide updated investment
information to a planned bureau-wide tracking tool. The bureau has also developed a new system development
methodology guide, but the guide has critical gaps. For example, although there are five development process
models allowed, including the traditional sequential approach and newer more iterative approaches, the guide
does not explain how to adapt processes and related work products for newer iterative approaches.
Furthermore, while the bureau has developed new draD requirements development and management
processes for system development within individual bureau directorates, it has not established a consistent
process bureau-wide as GAO recommended in 2005. Lack of a consistent bureau-wide process contributed to
significant cost and performance issues in the 2010 Decennial Census. Although the bureau plans to begin
operational development for the 2020 Decennial Census in fiscal year 2015, it has not finalized plans for
implementing its new investment management and system development processes across the bureau. Until
the...
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